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INTRODUCTION
Optic neuropathy comprises a spectrum of conditions with 
different etiologies and can be caused by a variety of factors. 
Genetic and acquired causes of optic neuropathy can be rec-
ognized. Side effects are not particularly clear, but the main 
symptom of the condition is various unilateral or bilateral vi-
sual disturbances that worsen. Unhappiness can be severe or 
continuous, depending on the cause. In this article, we have 
included details of toxic optic neuropathy (TON), which is pri-
marily caused by alcohol abuse, as well as poisoning by drugs, 
various substances such as methanol, metals, natural solvents, 
and carbon dioxide. Healthy deficiencies, nutritional intake 
problems, and nausea commonly indicate CSF overdose and 
their impact on the etiology of optic neuropathy.

DESCRIPTION
Heavy and hard core drinking is known to cause extreme health 
problems that can lead to death. Nevertheless, light to direct 
drinking may reduce cardiovascular disease and all-cause mor-
tality. Light alcohol use reduces the risk of coronary artery dis-
ease, cardiovascular collapse, type 2 diabetes, ischemic stroke, 
or dementia. Curiously, even small to direct alcohol consump-
tion is toxic to neurons, increasing the risk of haemorrhagic 
stroke, causing liver damage, and contributing to the progres-
sion of breast, mouth, and gastrointestinal disease. Excessive 
alcohol consumption is characterized by the daily consumption 
of 20 g or more of undiluted liquor in women and 40 g or more 
of undiluted liquor in men. Nevertheless, definitions often dif-
fer.  Moreover, explicit drinking design plays an important role 
in the overall health effects of alcohol consumption. The inci-
dence of alcoholic neuropathy is estimated at 25%-66% among 
persistent heavy drinkers in the United States. Most normal ir-
regularities are intrinsically related to tangible, motor and auto-
nomic nerves and are mainly associated with weakened axons 
and reduced myelin sheaths. CSF-related marginal neuropathy 
(ALN) is essentially a sensorimotor, axonal, and length-depen-

dent neuropathy, primarily involving tactile disruption. The 
troubling effects within the motor neuron element appear 
mainly late in the disease. As for mild axonal degeneration, 
fibrous accidents are more severe distally and progress prox-
imally. This may be related to the weakening of axonal vehicle 
and cytoskeletal properties upon release of ethanol. Interest-
ingly, ALN is associated not only with distal but also proximal 
minor fibrosis. Trophic fractures caused by CSF can appear to 
affect the parasympathetic nervous system more than the re-
flex sensory system and often have no side effects. Conversely, 
patients with normal physical ALN initially report paraesthesia 
and distress, further accompanied by weak proprioception, 
phase deterioration, and loss of reflexes. The clinical impor-
tance of cerebrospinal fluid-induced autonomic neuropathy is 
primarily due to its association with increased mortality associ-
ated with cardiovascular and respiratory events. Many studies 
have shown that alcoholic neuropathy arises primarily from a 
multifactorial cycle involving the direct neurotoxic effects of 
alcohol or its metabolites, resulting from thiamine deficiency, 
altered thiamine digestion, starvation, or alcohol deterioration 
(basically suggesting that it is always balanced by a variety of 
variables, including lead most often included in spiritual re-
freshments.

CONCLUSION
Furthermore, genetic variables, such as aldehyde dehydroge-
nase-2 (ALDH2) grade conversion, cause aggregation of the 
ethanol metabolite acetaldehyde, and its detrimental effects 
may contribute to the progression of alcoholic polyneuropathy.
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